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Maddox is a mage with dreams of immortality and a drinking problem. Heath is a faithless priest working as
an assassin for hire, paired with a sentient sword. Jessa, the last daughter in a long line of Thrycean tyrants,
is a timid young woman seeking to escape her domineering mother, Satryn.

Rivern, the greatest city in the Protectorate, is a place of arcane magic and mechanical wonders that has
stood for five hundred years as a bulwark against the tyrannical Stormlords of Thrycea. But Rivern's strong
foundation is beginning to crack. People are dying in their sleep, the dead are walking the streets, refugees
are flooding the city, and a mysterious Harbinger has returned with dire omens that could mean the end of
the Protectorate.

Murder, magic and politics create a menacing tangle that the three must resolve before the Protectorate is
crushed. But first they must save each other.

***Includes the first chapter of the sequel, The Mirrored City***
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From reader reviews:

Raymond Harris:

This The Queen of Lies (Architects of the Grand Design Book 1) usually are reliable for you who want to
certainly be a successful person, why. The explanation of this The Queen of Lies (Architects of the Grand
Design Book 1) can be among the great books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple
reading through food but feed you with information that possibly will shock your preceding knowledge. This
book will be handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed
people. Beside that this The Queen of Lies (Architects of the Grand Design Book 1) forcing you to have an
enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that we know it useful
in your day action. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Ann Davis:

The guide untitled The Queen of Lies (Architects of the Grand Design Book 1) is the book that
recommended to you to study. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to an
individual. The language that creator use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand.
The article author was did a lot of analysis when write the book, therefore the information that they share for
your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get the e-book of The Queen of Lies
(Architects of the Grand Design Book 1) from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Edmond Pounds:

Many people spending their period by playing outside with friends, fun activity together with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by reading a book. Ugh,
ya think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like The Queen of Lies (Architects of
the Grand Design Book 1) which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's find.

Eulalia Perry:

This The Queen of Lies (Architects of the Grand Design Book 1) is fresh way for you who has attention to
look for some information since it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge
more you know or you who still having bit of digest in reading this The Queen of Lies (Architects of the
Grand Design Book 1) can be the light food for you because the information inside this kind of book is easy
to get by means of anyone. These books develop itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, yeah I
mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in e-book form make them feel sleepy even dizzy
this reserve is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a e-book especially this one. You can find
actually looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-book sort for your better
life and knowledge.
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