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This book offers a fresh reading about the purpose for which Hebrews was written. In this book Whitlark
argues that Hebrews engages both the negative pressures (persecution) and positive attractions
(honor/prosperity) of its audience's Roman imperial context. Consequently, the audience of Hebrews appears
to be in danger of defecting to the pagan imperial context. Due to the imperial nature of these pressures,
Hebrews obliquely critiques the imperial script according to the rhetorical expectations in the first-century
Mediterranean world-namely, through the use of figured speech. This critique is the primary focus of
Whitlark's project. Whitlark examines Hebrews's figured response to the imperial hopes boasted by Rome
along with Rome's claim to eternal rule, to the power of life and death, and to be led by the true, victorious
ruler. Whitlark also makes a case for discerning Hebrews's response to the challenges of Flavian triumph.
Whitlark concludes his study by suggesting that Hebrews functions much like Revelation, that is, to resist the
draw of the Christians' Roman imperial context. This is done, in part, by providing a covert opposition to
Roman imperial discourse. He also offers evaluation of relapse theories for Hebrews, of Hebrews's place
among early Christian martyrdom, and of the nature of the resistance that Hebrews promotes.
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From reader reviews:

Kenneth Hill:

Now a day those who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not require people to be aware of each information they get. How people
have to be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Reading
through a book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Resisting Empire:
Rethinking the Purpose of the Letter to "the Hebrews" (The Library of New Testament Studies) book
because this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred per-cent
guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Kevin Mabry:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the subject Resisting Empire:
Rethinking the Purpose of the Letter to "the Hebrews" (The Library of New Testament Studies) suitable to
you? The particular book was written by well-known writer in this era. Often the book untitled Resisting
Empire: Rethinking the Purpose of the Letter to "the Hebrews" (The Library of New Testament Studies)is a
single of several books this everyone read now. This book was inspired many people in the world. When you
read this guide you will enter the new dimension that you ever know before. The author explained their plan
in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to recognise the core of this reserve. This book will give
you a lots of information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world in this book.

Linda Doyle:

The reserve untitled Resisting Empire: Rethinking the Purpose of the Letter to "the Hebrews" (The Library
of New Testament Studies) is the reserve that recommended to you to study. You can see the quality of the
book content that will be shown to a person. The language that writer use to explained their way of doing
something is easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of research when write the book, to ensure
the information that they share for your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of
Resisting Empire: Rethinking the Purpose of the Letter to "the Hebrews" (The Library of New Testament
Studies) from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Linda Cooper:

As we know that book is important thing to add our information for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we would like. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year
has been exactly added. This guide Resisting Empire: Rethinking the Purpose of the Letter to "the Hebrews"
(The Library of New Testament Studies) was filled in relation to science. Spend your free time to add your
knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading a
book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a book. In the modern era
like currently, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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