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Theatre of Real People offers fresh perspectives on the current fascination with putting people on stage who
present aspects of their own lives and who are not usually trained actors. After providing a history of this
mode of performance, and theoretical frameworks for its analysis, the book focuses on work developed by
seminal practitioners at Berlin's Hebbel am Ufer (HAU) production house. It invites the reader to explore the
HAU's innovative approach to Theatre of Real People, authenticity and cultural diversity during the period of
Matthias Lilienthal's leadership (2003–12).

Garde and Mumford also elucidate how Theatre of Real People can create and destabilise a sense of the
authentic, and suggest how Authenticity-Effects can present new ways of perceiving diverse and unfamiliar
people. Through a detailed analysis of key HAU productions such as Lilienthal's brainchild X-Apartments,
Mobile Academy's Blackmarket, and Rimini Protokoll's 100% City, the book explores both the artistic
agenda of an important European theatre institution, and a crucial aspect of contemporary theatre's social
engagement.
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From reader reviews:

Marguerite Boutte:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book particularly book
entitled Theatre of Real People: Diverse Encounters at Berlin's Hebbel am Ufer and Beyond (Methuen
Drama Engage) the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each aspect that maybe
unknown for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging just about every word written in a
publication then become one web form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get before. The
Theatre of Real People: Diverse Encounters at Berlin's Hebbel am Ufer and Beyond (Methuen Drama
Engage) giving you an additional experience more than blown away the mind but also giving you useful info
for your better life in this particular era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern at this point is your
body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished reading through it, like winning an activity. Do
you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Randall Hernandez:

Theatre of Real People: Diverse Encounters at Berlin's Hebbel am Ufer and Beyond (Methuen Drama
Engage) can be one of your nice books that are good idea. All of us recommend that straight away because
this book has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit
entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort to put every word
into delight arrangement in writing Theatre of Real People: Diverse Encounters at Berlin's Hebbel am Ufer
and Beyond (Methuen Drama Engage) yet doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest and also
based confirm resource info that maybe you can be considered one of it. This great information can drawn
you into fresh stage of crucial contemplating.

Helen Williams:

Book is one of source of expertise. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but also native
or citizen need book to know the upgrade information of year to year. As we know those books have many
advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the world. By the book
Theatre of Real People: Diverse Encounters at Berlin's Hebbel am Ufer and Beyond (Methuen Drama
Engage) we can acquire more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? To become creative
person must want to read a book. Just choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't become doubt
to change your life by this book Theatre of Real People: Diverse Encounters at Berlin's Hebbel am Ufer and
Beyond (Methuen Drama Engage). You can more attractive than now.

Herbert Gist:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information from a
book. Book is created or printed or highlighted from each source that will filled update of news. In this
modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social similar to



newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just trying to find
the Theatre of Real People: Diverse Encounters at Berlin's Hebbel am Ufer and Beyond (Methuen Drama
Engage) when you desired it?
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