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In Luminous Passage a well-known Buddhologist and longtime observer of Buddhism in the United States
presents the first comprehensive scholarly study of American Buddhism in nearly two decades. Charles S.
Prebish revisits the expanding frontier of the fastest growing religion in North America and describes its
historical development, its diversity, and the significance of this ancient tradition at century's end.

More than anything else, this is a book about American Buddhist communities (sanghas) and about life
within those communities. Prebish considers various Buddhist practices, rituals, and liturgies, as well as the
ways these communities have confronted the changing American spiritual landscape. In profiling several
different sanghas Prebish reveals the ways that Buddhism is being both reinvented and Westernized. He
includes the first exploration of the American Buddhist "cybersangha," a community that has emerged from
recent developments in information-exchange technology, and discusses the growing community of
"scholar-practitioners." The interactions of Buddhist identities that are related to ethnicity, gender, sexual
orientation, social engagement, and the healing professions are also examined. This book fully captures the
vibrancy and importance of Buddhism in American religious life today.

Finally, Prebish appraises the state of Buddhism at the millennium. Placing the development of American
Buddhism squarely in the midst of the religion's general globalization, he argues for an ecumenical
movement which will embrace Buddhist communities worldwide.
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From reader reviews:

James Reveles:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As we know that
book is very important normally. The book Luminous Passage: The Practice and Study of Buddhism in
America seemed to be making you to know about other expertise and of course you can take more
information. It is rather advantages for you. The guide Luminous Passage: The Practice and Study of
Buddhism in America is not only giving you considerably more new information but also for being your
friend when you feel bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your publication. Try to
make relationship with the book Luminous Passage: The Practice and Study of Buddhism in America. You
never experience lose out for everything if you read some books.

Allie Littlefield:

The publication untitled Luminous Passage: The Practice and Study of Buddhism in America is the reserve
that recommended to you to read. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to a
person. The language that author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The
copy writer was did a lot of study when write the book, to ensure the information that they share to your
account is absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get the e-book of Luminous Passage: The Practice
and Study of Buddhism in America from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Virginia Doak:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always aim to and must have the extra time or they will get wide
range of stress from both daily life and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not really a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do you have
when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you ever try
this one, reading books. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, typically the book you have
read is Luminous Passage: The Practice and Study of Buddhism in America.

Theresa Nash:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many problem for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading.
Some people likes examining, not only science book but in addition novel and Luminous Passage: The
Practice and Study of Buddhism in America or others sources were given know-how for you. After you
know how the good a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or
even students especially. Those publications are helping them to add their knowledge. In additional case,
beside science book, any other book likes Luminous Passage: The Practice and Study of Buddhism in
America to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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