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Did apes evolve from humans?

Sudden abrupt changes in which entirely new types of organisms come into existence almost instantaneously
do not fit the model of Modern Evolutionary Theory and the Darwinian model. In this remarkable 288 page
book written by Harvard trained evolutionary biologist Aaron Filler, MD, Ph.D.--a student of Stephen Jay
Gould and Ernst Mayr--we learn how modern biological evidence finally proves that sudden non-Darwinian
evolution has played a major role in a number of major events in the history of life including the origin of
humans.

Based on this updated biological information, Dr. Filler re-examines the latest fossil evidence to reveal that
the human body form is far more ancient than has been widely accepted--emerging abruptly, apparently due
to a Pax gene change--at the time of Morotopithecus 21.6 million years ago. As a consequence, Filler argues,
there is now compelling evidence that apes descended from humans and not the other way around.
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Rodrigue:

With other case, little people like to read book The Upright Ape: A New Origin of the Species. You can
choose the best book if you want reading a book. Providing we know about how is important any book The
Upright Ape: A New Origin of the Species. You can add know-how and of course you can around the world
with a book. Absolutely right, since from book you can recognize everything! From your country right up
until foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple point until wonderful thing you are able to know
that. In this era, you can open a book or even searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You need to
use it when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's go through.

James Benavidez:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the subject The Upright Ape:
A New Origin of the Species suitable to you? The book was written by well-known writer in this era. The
particular book untitled The Upright Ape: A New Origin of the Speciesis a single of several books that will
everyone read now. This specific book was inspired many men and women in the world. When you read this
guide you will enter the new age that you ever know just before. The author explained their thought in the
simple way, so all of people can easily to know the core of this guide. This book will give you a large
amount of information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world with this book.

Omar Yoder:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book specially book entitled The
Upright Ape: A New Origin of the Species your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in
each aspect that maybe mysterious for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging every word written
in a publication then become one web form conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never get just
before. The The Upright Ape: A New Origin of the Species giving you an additional experience more than
blown away your mind but also giving you useful data for your better life with this era. So now let us
demonstrate the relaxing pattern the following is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished
reading through it, like winning a sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Maritza Kress:

Is it you actually who having spare time and then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs
or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Upright Ape: A New Origin of the
Species can be the reply, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending
your extra time by reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have
than the others?
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