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In 1917 a bomb exploded in a Milwaukee police station, killing nine officers and a civilian. Those
responsible never were apprehended, but police, press, and public all assumed that the perpetrators were
Italian. Days later, eleven alleged Italian anarchists went to trial on unrelated charges involving a fracas that
had occurred two months before. Against the backdrop of World War I, and amidst a prevailing hatred and
fear of radical immigrants, the Italians had an unfair trial. The specter of the larger, uncharged crime of the
bombing haunted the proceedings and assured convictions of all eleven. Although Clarence Darrow led an
appeal that gained freedom for most of the convicted, the celebrated lawyer's methods themselves were
deeply suspect. The entire case left a dark, if hidden, stain on American justice.
    Largely overlooked for almost a century, the compelling story of this case emerges vividly in this
meticulously researched book by Dean A. Strang. In its focus on a moment when patriotism, nativism, and
terror swept the nation, Worse than the Devil exposes broad concerns that persist even today as the United
States continues to struggle with administering criminal justice to newcomers and outsiders.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Tapia:

This Worse than the Devil: Anarchists, Clarence Darrow, and Justice in a Time of Terror are usually reliable
for you who want to be a successful person, why. The explanation of this Worse than the Devil: Anarchists,
Clarence Darrow, and Justice in a Time of Terror can be one of the great books you must have will be giving
you more than just simple reading food but feed an individual with information that probably will shock your
earlier knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions
in the e-book and printed types. Beside that this Worse than the Devil: Anarchists, Clarence Darrow, and
Justice in a Time of Terror forcing you to have an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving
you tryout of critical thinking that could it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Laura Rogers:

Reading a book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With studying you can get a lot
of information which will give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can easily share
their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire all their reader with their story
or their experience. Not only the story that share in the books. But also they write about the data about
something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids, there are
many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their talent in writing, they
also doing some analysis before they write on their book. One of them is this Worse than the Devil:
Anarchists, Clarence Darrow, and Justice in a Time of Terror.

Donald Link:

The particular book Worse than the Devil: Anarchists, Clarence Darrow, and Justice in a Time of Terror has
a lot info on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was published by the very
famous author. Tom makes some research ahead of write this book. This particular book very easy to read
you may get the point easily after reading this article book.

Garth McDonald:

Reading a book to get new life style in this year; every people loves to read a book. When you learn a book
you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, due to the
fact book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, as
well as soon. The Worse than the Devil: Anarchists, Clarence Darrow, and Justice in a Time of Terror will
give you new experience in looking at a book.
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