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This Bright Light of Ours offers a tightly focused insider’s view of the community-based activism that was
the heart of the civil rights movement. A celebration of grassroots heroes, this book details through first-
person accounts the contributions of ordinary people who formed  the nonviolent army that won the fight for
voting rights.

Combining memoir and oral history, Maria Gitin fills a vital gap in civil rights history by focusing on the
neglected Freedom Summer of 1965 when hundreds of college students joined forces with local black
leaders to register thousands of new black voters in the rural South. Gitin was an idealistic nineteen-year-old
college freshman from a small farming community north of San Francisco who felt called to action when she
saw televised images of brutal attacks on peaceful demonstrators during Bloody Sunday, in Selma, Alabama.

Atypical among white civil rights volunteers, Gitin came from a rural low-income family. She raised funds
to attend an intensive orientation in Atlanta featuring now-legendary civil rights leaders. Her detailed letters
include the first narrative account of this orientation and the only in-depth field report from a teenage
Summer Community Organization and Political Education (SCOPE) project participant.

Gitin details the dangerous life of civil rights activists in Wilcox County, Alabama, where she was assigned.
She tells of threats and arrests, but also of forming deep friendships and of falling in love. More than four
decades later, Gitin returned to Wilcox County to revisit the people and places that she could never forget
and to discover their views of the “outside agitators” who had come to their community. Through
conversational interviews with more than fifty Wilcox County residents and former civil rights workers, she
has created a channel for the voices of these unheralded heroes who formed the backbone of the civil rights
movement.
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From reader reviews:

Tiffany Hassell:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive currently, people have
do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and notice simply
by surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. Yes,
by reading a publication your ability to survive raise then having chance to remain than other is high. For
yourself who want to start reading a book, we give you this particular This Bright Light of Ours: Stories
from the Voting Rights Fight (Modern South) book as nice and daily reading book. Why, because this book
is usually more than just a book.

Brent Abramson:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be revise about what going on or info even knowledge to
make these individuals keep up with the era and that is always change and make progress. Some of you
maybe can update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming
to anyone is you don't know what kind you should start with. This This Bright Light of Ours: Stories from
the Voting Rights Fight (Modern South) is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, as this
book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Catherine Nelson:

This This Bright Light of Ours: Stories from the Voting Rights Fight (Modern South) tend to be reliable for
you who want to be described as a successful person, why. The reason why of this This Bright Light of Ours:
Stories from the Voting Rights Fight (Modern South) can be among the great books you must have will be
giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed you actually with information that maybe will
shock your previous knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and
whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this This Bright Light of Ours:
Stories from the Voting Rights Fight (Modern South) giving you an enormous of experience for example
rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that could it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have
it and revel in reading.

Gloria Quinones:

The book untitled This Bright Light of Ours: Stories from the Voting Rights Fight (Modern South) contain a
lot of information on the item. The writer explains your ex idea with easy means. The language is very clear
and understandable all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was authored by
famous author. The author will take you in the new age of literary works. It is possible to read this book
because you can keep reading your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book with anywhere and
anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open up their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice
examine.
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