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Lobbying America tells the story of the political mobilization of American business in the 1970s and 1980s.
Benjamin Waterhouse traces the rise and ultimate fragmentation of a broad-based effort to unify the business
community and promote a fiscally conservative, antiregulatory, and market-oriented policy agenda to
Congress and the country at large. Arguing that business's political involvement was historically distinctive
during this period, Waterhouse illustrates the changing power and goals of America's top corporate leaders.

Examining the rise of the Business Roundtable and the revitalization of older business associations such as
the National Association of Manufacturers and the U.S. Chamber of Commerce, Waterhouse takes readers
inside the mind-set of the powerful CEOs who responded to the crises of inflation, recession, and declining
industrial productivity by organizing an effective and disciplined lobbying force. By the mid-1970s, that
coalition transformed the economic power of the capitalist class into a broad-reaching political movement
with real policy consequences. Ironically, the cohesion that characterized organized business failed to
survive the ascent of conservative politics during the 1980s, and many of the coalition's top goals on
regulatory and fiscal policies remained unfulfilled. The industrial CEOs who fancied themselves the "voice
of business" found themselves one voice among many vying for influence in an increasingly turbulent and
unsettled economic landscape.

Complicating assumptions that wealthy business leaders naturally get their way in Washington, Lobbying
America shows how economic and political powers interact in the American democratic system.
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From reader reviews:

Therese McGaha:

Do you one of people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on guys
that aren't like that. This Lobbying America: The Politics of Business from Nixon to NAFTA (Politics and
Society in Twentieth-Century America) book is readable by simply you who hate the straight word style.
You will find the info here are arrange for enjoyable looking at experience without leaving even decrease the
knowledge that want to offer to you. The writer associated with Lobbying America: The Politics of Business
from Nixon to NAFTA (Politics and Society in Twentieth-Century America) content conveys the thought
easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content material but it
just different such as it. So , do you continue to thinking Lobbying America: The Politics of Business from
Nixon to NAFTA (Politics and Society in Twentieth-Century America) is not loveable to be your top
collection reading book?

Tom Seaman:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to decide on book
like comic, brief story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not trying Lobbying America: The
Politics of Business from Nixon to NAFTA (Politics and Society in Twentieth-Century America) that give
your satisfaction preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading routine all over the world
can be said as the means for people to know world far better then how they react toward the world. It can't be
said constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to end up
being success person. So , for all you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you may pick
Lobbying America: The Politics of Business from Nixon to NAFTA (Politics and Society in Twentieth-
Century America) become your current starter.

Frank Moore:

This Lobbying America: The Politics of Business from Nixon to NAFTA (Politics and Society in Twentieth-
Century America) is great publication for you because the content that is certainly full of information for you
who have always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. That book reveal it info
accurately using great plan word or we can declare no rambling sentences included. So if you are read it
hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight forward sentences but hard
core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Lobbying America: The Politics of Business from
Nixon to NAFTA (Politics and Society in Twentieth-Century America) in your hand like obtaining the world
in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no e-book that offer you world throughout
ten or fifteen second right but this reserve already do that. So , it is good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs.
stressful do you still doubt this?



Blake Darden:

This Lobbying America: The Politics of Business from Nixon to NAFTA (Politics and Society in Twentieth-
Century America) is brand new way for you who has attention to look for some information given it relief
your hunger info. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still having
little bit of digest in reading this Lobbying America: The Politics of Business from Nixon to NAFTA
(Politics and Society in Twentieth-Century America) can be the light food in your case because the
information inside this book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books produce itself in the form that is
reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book type. People who think that in guide form make them feel
tired even dizzy this book is the answer. So there is not any in reading a e-book especially this one. You can
find what you are looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book
sort for your better life as well as knowledge.
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