
Social Work ASWB Bachelors Exam Guide: A
Comprehensive Study Guide for Success

Dawn Apgar PhD LSW ACSW

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://youkof.club/go/read.php?id=0826132758
http://youkof.club/go/read.php?id=0826132758
http://youkof.club/go/read.php?id=0826132758


Social Work ASWB Bachelors Exam Guide: A
Comprehensive Study Guide for Success

Dawn Apgar PhD LSW ACSW

Social Work ASWB Bachelors Exam Guide: A Comprehensive Study Guide for Success Dawn Apgar
PhD LSW ACSW

"Dawn gave us the tools we needed to take the exam, and let me tell youóshe was on point! Not only did she
cover the content areas we needed to focus in on, but she also showed us how to read and interpret the
questions on the exam."

óAmmu D. Kowolik, LMSW, McSilver Institute for Poverty Policy and Research

Students and social workers preparing for the social work bachelors licensure exam will find an invaluable
study resource in the Social Work ASWBÆ Bachelors Exam Guide. Written by a prominent social work leader
and trainer for social work licensing exams in the United States, this guide is based on years of time-tested
exam prep workshops conducted by the author. It mirrors the ASWB Bachelors "Knowledge, Skills, and
Abilities" upon which the exam is based and incorporates information from the DSMÆ-5.

The guide is comprehensive yet focuses on the material most likely to be included on the exam, so readers
can prioritize information as they study. A self-assessment section helps identify strengths and weaknesses
before tackling the material. The author shares her extensive knowledge of the exam by providing useful
test-taking strategies and tips for overcoming test anxiety. The 170-question practice test at the end of the
guide (with explanations of the correct answers) mirrors the actual exam in both length and structure.
Content includes human development, human behavior, diversity, assessment, direct and indirect practice,
and professional values and ethics. This book will be a valuable asset for social workers throughout the
United States and Canada.

KEY FEATURES:

Developed by a highly respected educator of social work licensure candidates●

Covers all the content areas on the bachelors and associate examinations, including new content added in●

2015
Begins with a self-assessment section to help identify areas of strength and weakness●

Offers a wealth of test-taking tips and strategies to foster exam confidence●

Includes a practice test (with explanations of the correct answers) that mirrors the exam●

ASWB is a registered service mark of the Association of Social Work Boards, which neither sponsors nor
endorses this product.
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From reader reviews:

Margarita Toman:

The actual book Social Work ASWB Bachelors Exam Guide: A Comprehensive Study Guide for Success
has a lot of information on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was
written by the very famous author. This articles author makes some research before write this book. This
particular book very easy to read you may get the point easily after reading this article book.

David Anthony:

The reason why? Because this Social Work ASWB Bachelors Exam Guide: A Comprehensive Study Guide
for Success is an unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap it but latter it will jolt
you with the secret that inside. Reading this book alongside it was fantastic author who have write the book
in such amazing way makes the content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining method but still
convey the meaning completely. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any longer or
you going to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of benefits than the other book include such as
help improving your expertise and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to hold off having that
book? If I were you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Matthew McDaniel:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you might have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try issue that really opposite from
that. A single activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Social Work ASWB Bachelors Exam
Guide: A Comprehensive Study Guide for Success, it is possible to enjoy both. It is very good combination
right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout folks. What?
Still don't buy it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Michelle Bachman:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
anyone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information simpler to
share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and soon. You
will see that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. Typically the book that recommended
to you is Social Work ASWB Bachelors Exam Guide: A Comprehensive Study Guide for Success this guide
consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. That book was represented how does the
world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The actual
writer made some research when he makes this book. That is why this book suitable all of you.
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