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Your blueprint to develop and manage effective co-occurring treatment programs!

Sequential or parallel treatments for co-occurring disorders are much less effective than a quality co-
occurring treatment program. Most mental health and substance abuse professionals know how to provide an
effective program for individuals with a substance use or mental health disorder, but few are aware of the
issues involved in providing services for those with dual diagnosis. Designing, Implementing, and Managing
Treatment Services for Individuals with Co-Occurring Mental Health and Substance Use Disorders:
Blueprints for Action gives you with the tools you need to develop an effective program specific to co-
occurring treatment as well as to implement and manage the program's services.

Author Edward Hendrickson shares his knowledge from over two decades of developing and implementing
co-occurring treatment services. Designing, Implementing, and Managing Treatment Services for Individuals
with Co-Occurring Mental Health and Substance Use Disorders: Blueprints for Action is thorough,
insightful, and informative, covering all facets of plan and execution, helping you form strategies to address
a co-occurring treatment program’s unique issues. The book examines the historical basis of the current dual
treatment system to provide the philosophical tenets the program must follow and the essential qualities for
an effective treatment program. It explores the issues in creating a new program or expanding an existing
one, as well as the mechanics of day-to-day management. Helpful appendices, tables, and case examples
illustrate the discussion.

Designing, Implementing, and Managing Treatment Services for Individuals with Co-Occurring Mental
Health and Substance Use Disorders: Blueprints for Action discusses:

developing the necessary infrastructure for integrated treatment programs●

the eight essential qualities for an effective treatment program●

choosing a target population●

identifying specific services to implement●

implementation of services in an existing treatment setting●

implementation of services in a non-mental health or substance abuse setting●

hiring and training staff●

clinical supervision and human resource development●

program management issues●

multilevel and multi-organization systems●

steps to ensure program survival●

Designing, Implementing, and Managing Treatment Services for Individuals with Co-Occurring Mental
Health and Substance Use Disorders: Blueprints for Action is more than an instructional text for students; it



is an essential resource for any substance abuse and mental health professional considering implementing a
co-occurring treatment program.
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From reader reviews:

Mike Munguia:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading
practice give you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the particular information
inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of
guide you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with training books but if you want sense happy
read one with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. Often the Designing, Implementing, and
Managing Treatment Services for Individuals with Co-Occurring Mental Health and Substance Use
Disorders: Blueprints for Action (Haworth Addictions Treatment) is kind of reserve which is giving the
reader unforeseen experience.

Warren Johnson:

Designing, Implementing, and Managing Treatment Services for Individuals with Co-Occurring Mental
Health and Substance Use Disorders: Blueprints for Action (Haworth Addictions Treatment) can be one of
your beginner books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this guide has
good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but
delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort to place every word into enjoyment arrangement
in writing Designing, Implementing, and Managing Treatment Services for Individuals with Co-Occurring
Mental Health and Substance Use Disorders: Blueprints for Action (Haworth Addictions Treatment) yet
doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource data that maybe
you can be considered one of it. This great information can certainly drawn you into new stage of crucial
contemplating.

Rigoberto Adams:

Do you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Attempt to pick
one book that you never know the inside because don't determine book by its deal with may doesn't work
here is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside
appearance likes. Maybe you answer can be Designing, Implementing, and Managing Treatment Services for
Individuals with Co-Occurring Mental Health and Substance Use Disorders: Blueprints for Action (Haworth
Addictions Treatment) why because the fantastic cover that make you consider in regards to the content will
not disappoint anyone. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading
sixth sense will directly assist you to pick up this book.

Susan Brooks:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the very
best book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is called of book



Designing, Implementing, and Managing Treatment Services for Individuals with Co-Occurring Mental
Health and Substance Use Disorders: Blueprints for Action (Haworth Addictions Treatment). You can
contribute your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge
and make you happier to read. It is most essential that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from
one location to other place.
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