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Together, we are stronger.

The first three novellas of the popular Accidental Sorcerers series have joined forces!

Accidental Sorcerers: Invaders just across the river. A powerful spell hidden in a child’s rhyme. When an
untrained boy awakens an ice dragon to protect his village, and lives to tell the tale, not even the Conclave of
Sorcerers can predict what happens next.

Accidental Sorcerers brings to life an unforgettable tale of love and loyalty in the world of Termag. Feel the
magic!

Water and Chaos: Mik and Sura are growing ever stronger as apprentice sorcerers, but neither knew what
living in Mik's hometown would do to their relationship. Torn apart by misunderstanding, Mik volunteers for
a hazardous mission in a distant land. Now Sura must learn to trust, and Mik must learn the true meaning of
home.

The Sorcerer’s Daughter: As Bailar and his apprentices help the Conclave prepare for conflict with the
rogue sorcerers, Sura learns that she is a descendant of a noble House in the Alliance. But when she
discovers the price of her history, it may be too late.

Includes the bonus short stories from the original eBooks.
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Little:

Book is actually written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A guide Accidental Sorcerers: the First Collection
(Accidental Sorcerers Collection) (Volume 1) will make you to be smarter. You can feel more confidence if
you can know about every little thing. But some of you think which open or reading some sort of book make
you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you searching for best book or
ideal book with you?

Patricia Gagliano:

The book Accidental Sorcerers: the First Collection (Accidental Sorcerers Collection) (Volume 1) will bring
one to the new experience of reading any book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. Should
you try to find new book to learn, this book very appropriate to you. The book Accidental Sorcerers: the First
Collection (Accidental Sorcerers Collection) (Volume 1) is much recommended to you to see. You can also
get the e-book from official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Helen Chandler:

Accidental Sorcerers: the First Collection (Accidental Sorcerers Collection) (Volume 1) can be one of your
beginner books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this publication has
good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining
however delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her effort that will put every word into
enjoyment arrangement in writing Accidental Sorcerers: the First Collection (Accidental Sorcerers
Collection) (Volume 1) yet doesn't forget the main place, giving the reader the hottest along with based
confirm resource data that maybe you can be one of it. This great information may drawn you into fresh
stage of crucial imagining.

Sheila Collins:

A lot of people said that they feel bored when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt the idea when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose often the book Accidental Sorcerers: the First Collection
(Accidental Sorcerers Collection) (Volume 1) to make your personal reading is interesting. Your personal
skill of reading ability is developing when you such as reading. Try to choose simple book to make you
enjoy you just read it and mingle the sensation about book and reading especially. It is to be 1st opinion for
you to like to open a book and learn it. Beside that the reserve Accidental Sorcerers: the First Collection
(Accidental Sorcerers Collection) (Volume 1) can to be your brand new friend when you're feel alone and
confuse with what must you're doing of the time.
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