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When bestselling author Max Bowman invites two female writers to collaborate with him on a book, he
brings his wife Chrissy along on a beach vacation with his two co-authors and their husbands. Like Max,
both of the other men are firm believers in the idea that sometimes a woman needs her husband to be her
strict daddy as well, even if that means taking her over his knee for good, hard, bare-bottom spanking when
she has been naughty.

As the couples settle in to enjoy their vacation, however, something seems amiss, and they begin to suspect
that someone may be stalking them. Determined to keep their wives safe, the three firm-handed husbands
make it clear that little girls who disobey their daddies and run off on their own end up with blushing cheeks
and bottoms which are sore from more than just a spanking. But can the group figure out what is going on
before it is too late and their plans for a relaxing getaway end in disaster?

Publisher’s Note: Their Strict Daddies is an erotic romance novel that includes spankings, sexual scenes, age
play, anal play, elements of medical play, and more. If such material offends you, please don’t buy this book.
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From reader reviews:

Joshua Sigmund:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time? Sure,
you can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or even read a book called Their Strict
Daddies? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time with the
favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have various other opinion?

Eric Bass:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the title Their Strict
Daddies suitable to you? The particular book was written by famous writer in this era. The particular book
untitled Their Strict Daddiesis one of several books which everyone read now. This specific book was
inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new dimension that you
ever know prior to. The author explained their strategy in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to
understand the core of this book. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. So that
you can see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Elliott Salazar:

Their Strict Daddies can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that
straight away because this publication has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in words, easy
to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The copy writer giving his/her
effort to put every word into joy arrangement in writing Their Strict Daddies although doesn't forget the
main level, giving the reader the hottest and based confirm resource information that maybe you can be one
of it. This great information can certainly drawn you into completely new stage of crucial thinking.

Lorraine Paisley:

Within this era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more special than
other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you are related
is just spending your time very little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of many
books in the top record in your reading list is usually Their Strict Daddies. This book and that is qualified as
The Hungry Hills can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking way up and review this book you
can get many advantages.
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