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For Danielle Allen, punishment is more a window onto democratic Athens' fundamental values than simply a
set of official practices. From imprisonment to stoning to refusal of burial, instances of punishment in
ancient Athens fueled conversations among ordinary citizens and political and literary figures about the
nature of justice. Re-creating in vivid detail the cultural context of this conversation, Allen shows that
punishment gave the community an opportunity to establish a shining myth of harmony and cleanliness: that
the city could be purified of anger and social struggle, and perfect order achieved. Each member of the city--
including notably women and slaves--had a specific role to play in restoring equilibrium among punisher,
punished, and society. The common view is that democratic legal processes moved away from the
"emotional and personal" to the "rational and civic," but Allen shows that anger, honor, reciprocity,
spectacle, and social memory constantly prevailed in Athenian law and politics.

Allen draws upon oratory, tragedy, and philosophy to present the lively intellectual climate in which
punishment was incurred, debated, and inflicted by Athenians. Broad in scope, this book is one of the first to
offer both a full account of punishment in antiquity and an examination of the political stakes of democratic
punishment. It will engage classicists, political theorists, legal historians, and anyone wishing to learn more
about the relations between institutions and culture, normative ideas and daily events, punishment and
democracy.
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From reader reviews:

Harold Martinez:

With other case, little individuals like to read book The World of Prometheus: The Politics of Punishing in
Democratic Athens. You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. As long as we know about
how is important any book The World of Prometheus: The Politics of Punishing in Democratic Athens. You
can add know-how and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, mainly because
from book you can realize everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will find
yourself known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we can easily open
a book or searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel weary to go to
the library. Let's study.

Robin Castillo:

The actual book The World of Prometheus: The Politics of Punishing in Democratic Athens has a lot details
on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was published by the very
famous author. The author makes some research just before write this book. This particular book very easy to
read you may get the point easily after reading this article book.

Richard Lamm:

You could spend your free time to learn this book this book. This The World of Prometheus: The Politics of
Punishing in Democratic Athens is simple to develop you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train
and also soon. If you did not have much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy the actual e-
book. It is make you better to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. Consequently there
are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Brianna Bell:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can choose
the best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is named of
book The World of Prometheus: The Politics of Punishing in Democratic Athens. You can add your
knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make anyone happier
to read. It is most essential that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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