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Although Bernard Lonergan is known primarily for his cognitional theory and theological methodology, he
long sought to formulate a modern philosophy of history free of progressive and Marxist biases. Yet he never
addressed this in any single work, and his reflections on the subject are scattered in various writings.

In this pioneering work, Thomas McPartland shows how Lonergan’s overall philosophical position offers a
fresh and comprehensive basis for considering historiography. Taking Lonergan’s philosophy of historical
existence into the realm of an epistemological philosophy of history, he demonstrates how the philosopher’s
approach builds on the actual performance of historians and, as a result, integrates the insights of historical
specialists into a framework of functional complementarity.

McPartland draws on all of Lonergan’s philosophical writing—as well as on the vast literature of
historiography—to detail Lonergan’s notions of historical method, historical objectivity, and historical
knowledge. Along the way, he explains what Lonergan means by hermeneutics; by historical description,
explanation, ideal-types, and narrative; by evaluative and dialectical analyses; and how these elements are all
functionally related to each other. He also delineates the defining features of psychohistory, cultural history,
intellectual history, history of ideas, and history of philosophy, indicating how these disciplines play
complementary roles in the critical encounter with the past.

Ultimately, McPartland argues that Lonergan has established the principles of a historical discipline—the
history of consciousness—that weaves together a philosophy of consciousness with rigorous historical
research to grasp long-term trends resulting from “differentiations of consciousness.” His work offers a
distinct perspective on historical method that takes historical objectivity seriously while providing new
insight into the thought of this important philosopher.
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From reader reviews:

Henry Major:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students since they are still students or the item for all people in
the world, the particular best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that issue above. Every person
has several personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they
don't would like do that. You must know how great along with important the book Lonergan and
Historiography: The Epistemological Philosophy of History. All type of book can you see on many
resources. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

David Binkley:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind skill or
thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book as compared to can
satisfy your limited time to read it because all of this time you only find reserve that need more time to be
examine. Lonergan and Historiography: The Epistemological Philosophy of History can be your answer
because it can be read by a person who have those short free time problems.

Bernard Davisson:

Is it you actually who having spare time after that spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Lonergan and
Historiography: The Epistemological Philosophy of History can be the reply, oh how comes? The new book
you know. You are thus out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this new era is common not a
nerd activity. So what these publications have than the others?

John Rivera:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many query for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes
reading through, not only science book but also novel and Lonergan and Historiography: The
Epistemological Philosophy of History or perhaps others sources were given information for you. After you
know how the fantastic a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science publication was created for
teacher or even students especially. Those publications are helping them to bring their knowledge. In some
other case, beside science reserve, any other book likes Lonergan and Historiography: The Epistemological
Philosophy of History to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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