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Brown skin has a naturally warm, glowing complexion that ranges in shade from yellow to olive to dark
brown and black (Asian, Latin, African-American, and Native American skin). The extra melanin that
imparts these rich tones and helps protect skin from the sun can also make brown skin vulnerable to
discoloration, uneven tone, scarring, and breakouts. This unique book will help you enhance and protect the
health and beauty of your brown skin, as well as your hair and nails. Dr. Susan Taylor, a Harvard-trained
dermatologist, bases her advice on more than twenty years of experience treating patients in private practice
and at the Skin of Color Center in New York City, which she founded.

Dr. Taylor explains how to:

Attain and maintain flawless skin●

Avoid breakouts, discolorations, and ashen skin●

Prevent and camouflage scars●

Choose and use makeup for a perfect match year-round●

Style hair safely to avoid damage, hair loss, and skin irritation●

Detect and protect against skin cancer●

. . . and much more!
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From reader reviews:

Lisa King:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they are still students or the idea for all people in
the world, exactly what the best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that problem above. Every
person has various personality and hobby per other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they
don't want do that. You must know how great and also important the book Dr. Susan Taylor's Rx for Brown
Skin: Your Prescription for Flawless Skin, Hair, and Nails. All type of book would you see on many sources.
You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Daniel Moore:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the subject Dr. Susan
Taylor's Rx for Brown Skin: Your Prescription for Flawless Skin, Hair, and Nails suitable to you? The book
was written by well-known writer in this era. The particular book untitled Dr. Susan Taylor's Rx for Brown
Skin: Your Prescription for Flawless Skin, Hair, and Nailsis the main of several books that everyone read
now. This specific book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this book you will enter the
new dimensions that you ever know before. The author explained their thought in the simple way, so all of
people can easily to be aware of the core of this reserve. This book will give you a lot of information about
this world now. To help you to see the represented of the world with this book.

Michael Medellin:

The book Dr. Susan Taylor's Rx for Brown Skin: Your Prescription for Flawless Skin, Hair, and Nails will
bring you to definitely the new experience of reading a book. The author style to describe the idea is very
unique. In case you try to find new book you just read, this book very suited to you. The book Dr. Susan
Taylor's Rx for Brown Skin: Your Prescription for Flawless Skin, Hair, and Nails is much recommended to
you to see. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Ronald Griffin:

Reading a book to get new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to go through a book. When
you read a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your
knowledge, mainly because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on
what types of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your review, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, in addition
to soon. The Dr. Susan Taylor's Rx for Brown Skin: Your Prescription for Flawless Skin, Hair, and Nails
provide you with new experience in studying a book.
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