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Referring to a past that never was, déjà vu shares a structure not only with fiction, but also with the ever
more sophisticated effects of media technology. Tracing the term from the end of the nineteenth century,
when it was first popularized in the pages of the Revue philosophique, Peter Krapp examines the genealogy
and history of the singular and unrepeatable experience of déjà vu. This provocative book offers a refreshing
counterpoint to the clichéd celebrations of cultural memory and forces us do a double take on the
sanctimonious warnings against forgetting so common in our time.

Disturbances of cultural memory—screen memories, false recognitions, premonitions—disrupt the comfort
zone of memorial culture: strictly speaking, déjà vu is neither a failure of memory nor a form of forgetting.
Krapp’s analysis of such disturbances in literature, art, and mass media introduces, historicizes, and theorizes
what it means to speak of an economy of attention or distraction. Reaching from the early psychoanalytic
texts of Sigmund Freud to the plays of Heiner Müller, this exploration of the effects of déjà vu pivots around
the work of Walter Benjamin and includes readings of kitsch and aura in Andy Warhol’s work, of cinematic
violence and certain exaggerated claims about shooting and cutting, of the memorial character of
architecture, and of the high expectations raised by the Internet.
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From reader reviews:

Carissa Taylor:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing for us
to learn everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim as well as goal; it means that publication has
different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They are reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby is reading a book. Consider the person who don't like examining a
book? Sometime, individual feel need book when they found difficult problem or maybe exercise. Well,
probably you will need this Deja Vu: Aberrations Of Cultural Memory (Electronic Mediations).

Rose Knowlton:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a book will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a book you will get new information because book is one of a number of ways to share the
information or even their idea. Second, reading through a book will make a person more imaginative. When
you examining a book especially fictional works book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the
story how the characters do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to others. When you
read this Deja Vu: Aberrations Of Cultural Memory (Electronic Mediations), you can tells your family,
friends along with soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a
book.

Pauline Stern:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the extra time or they
will get lots of stress from both way of life and work. So , if we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity are there when the
spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one,
reading ebooks. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, often the book you have read
is definitely Deja Vu: Aberrations Of Cultural Memory (Electronic Mediations).

Ian Sharpless:

With this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability to do something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple way to have that. What you are
related is just spending your time not much but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of the
books in the top checklist in your reading list is actually Deja Vu: Aberrations Of Cultural Memory
(Electronic Mediations). This book which can be qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in
growing to be precious person. By looking up and review this guide you can get many advantages.
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