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Central to the repertoire of Western art music since the 18th century, the symphony has come to be regarded
as one of the ultimate compositional challenges. Surprisingly, heretofore there has been no truly extensive,
broad-based treatment of the genre, and the best of the existing studies are now several decades old. In this
five-volume series, A. Peter Brown explores the symphony from its 18th-century beginnings to the end of
the 20th century. Synthesizing the enormous scholarly literature, Brown presents up-to-date overviews of the
status of research, discusses any important former or remaining problems of attribution, illuminates the style
of specific works and their contexts, and samples early writings on their reception. The Symphonic
Repertoire provides an unmatched compendium of knowledge for the student, teacher, performer, and
sophisticated amateur. The series is being launched with two volumes on the Viennese symphony.

Volume IV
The Second Golden Age of the Viennese Symphony
Brahms, Bruckner, Dvorák, Mahler,
and Selected Contemporaries

Although during the mid-19th century the geographic center of the symphony in the Germanic territories
moved west and north from Vienna to Leipzig, during the last third of the century it returned to the old
Austrian lands with the works of Brahms, Bruckner, Dvorák, and Mahler. After nearly a half century in
hibernation, the sleeping Viennese giant awoke to what some viewed as a reincarnation of Beethoven with
the first hearing of Brahms’s Symphony No. 1, which was premiered at Vienna in December 1876. Even
though Bruckner had composed some gigantic symphonies prior to Brahms’s first contribution, their full
impact was not felt until the composer’s complete texts became available after World War II. Although
Dvorák was often viewed as a nationalist composer, in his symphonic writing his primary influences were
Beethoven, Schubert, and Brahms. For both Bruckner and Mahler, the symphony constituted the heart of
their output; for Brahms and Dvorák, it occupied a less central place. Yet for all of them, the key figure of
the past remained Beethoven. The symphonies of these four composers, together with the works of
Goldmark, Zemlinsky, Schoenberg, Berg, Smetana, Fibich, Janácek, and others are treated in Volume IV,
The Second Golden Age of the Viennese Symphony, covering the period from roughly 1860 to 1930.
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From reader reviews:

Dale Winsett:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading practice give
you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the
book which improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of book you
read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with education books but if you want feel happy read one
together with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The The Symphonic Repertoire: Volume 4. The
Second Golden Age of the Viennese Symphony: Brahms, Bruckner, Dvork, Mahler, and Selected
Contemporaries is kind of publication which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

David Williams:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended to you is The Symphonic Repertoire: Volume 4. The Second Golden Age of the Viennese
Symphony: Brahms, Bruckner, Dvork, Mahler, and Selected Contemporaries this reserve consist a lot of the
information in the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented so why is the world has
grown up. The language styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made
some investigation when he makes this book. This is why this book appropriate all of you.

Katrina Varga:

Many people spending their period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading a book. Ugh, do
you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It okay you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like The Symphonic Repertoire:
Volume 4. The Second Golden Age of the Viennese Symphony: Brahms, Bruckner, Dvork, Mahler, and
Selected Contemporaries which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's notice.

William Lebel:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got pupils? We believe that that query was
given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. Therefore
you know that little person like reading or as studying become their hobby. You should know that reading is
very important and book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except your
teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update concerning something by book. Many kinds of books
that can you go onto be your object. One of them are these claims The Symphonic Repertoire: Volume 4.
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